
SPECIAL

Victoria Government Gazette
No. S 430 Friday 23 December 2011
By Authority of Victorian Government Printer

Transport (Compliance and Miscellaneous) Act 1983
CONDITIONS UNDER SECTION 220D

I, Hector McKenzie, Director of Public Transport, pursuant to section 220D of the Transport 
(Compliance and Miscellaneous) Act 1983, hereby determine and publish in the Government 
Gazette the following conditions (the 2012 Fares Amending Conditions – General) which amend 
the conditions under section 220D of the Transport (Compliance and Miscellaneous) Act 
1983 contained in the Victorian Fares and Ticketing Manual (General) (effective 12 March 2011) 
published in the Victoria Government Gazette No. S 77 dated Thursday 10 March 2011 as amended 
by the conditions under section 220D of the Transport (Compliance and Miscellaneous) Act 
1983 published in the Victoria Government Gazette No. S 131 dated Wednesday 20 April 2011, the 
Victoria Government Gazette No. S 210 dated Thursday 30 June 2011 and the Victoria Government 
Gazette No. S 242 dated Monday 25 July 2011.

The 2012 Fares Amending Conditions – General take effect on and from 1 January 2012 and 
expire on 31 December 2012.
Dated 23 December 2011

HECTOR McKENZIE
Director of Public Transport 



2 S 430 23 December 2011 Victoria Government Gazette

2012 FARES AMENDING CONDITIONS – GENERAL
The conditions under section 220D of the Transport (Compliance and Miscellaneous) Act 

1983 contained in the Victorian Fares and Ticketing Manual (General) (effective 12 March 2011) 
published in the Victoria Government Gazette No. S 77 dated Thursday 10 March 2011 (the 
General Manual) as amended by the conditions under section 220D of the Transport (Compliance 
and Miscellaneous) Act 1983 published in the Victoria Government Gazette No. S 131 dated 
Wednesday 20 April 2011, the Victoria Government Gazette No. S 210 dated Thursday 30 June 
2011 and the Victoria Government Gazette No. S 242 dated 25 July 2011 (respectively the First 
Amending Conditions, the Second Amending Conditions and the Third Amending Conditions), are 
amended as follows. 

In these amending conditions, after this paragraph, a reference to the General Manual is a 
reference to the conditions contained in the General Manual as amended by the First Amending 
Conditions, the Second Amending conditions and the Third Amending Conditions.

The amendments made by these amending conditions apply in respect of entitlements to use a 
public transport service that are subject to the conditions contained in the General Manual and that 
are able to be exercised on or after the commencement of these amending conditions, including, 
except in relation to fares that that were paid or payable before that commencement, entitlements 
that existed, but had not been exercised, before these amending conditions were published in the 
Government Gazette. 

The amendments made by these amending conditions cease to have effect on 31 December 
2012.

In Chapter 2 of the General Manual, under the heading ‘Metcards’ for the two tables under the 
heading ‘FARES’ substitute –
‘

Zones 1 2 1 2
2 hour Full $4.00 $3.00 $6.50

Concession $2.60 $2.00 $3.70
Daily Full $7.60 $5.40 $11.90

Concession $4.00 $3.00 $6.30
10 x 2 hour
5 x Daily
Weekly

Full $32.80 $22.60 $55.40
Concession $16.40 $11.30 $27.70

Monthly Full $122.80 $82.20 $189.20
Concession $61.40 $41.10 $94.60

Yearly Full $1306.50 $871.00 $2021.50

FULL CONCESSION
City Saver x 10 (Within City Saver area) $24.40 $12.20
City Saver $3.10 $1.80
Off-Peak Daily (Zones 1+2) $11.00 $5.50
5 x Weekend Daily $16.50
Sunday Saver (Zones 1+2) $3.50
5 x Seniors Daily (Zones 1+2) $18.00
Seniors Daily (Zones 1+2) $3.80

’.



Victoria Government Gazette   S 430 23 December 2011 3

In Chapter 2 of the General Manual, for the table under the heading ‘Fringe zone boundaries’ 
substitute –
‘
ZONE FULL FARE

2 HOUR
CONCESSION
2 HOUR

Zone C
(future Zone 3)

$2.20 $1.10

Zone D
(future Zone 4)

$2.20 $1.10

Zone C+D
(future Zone 3+4)

$3.50 $1.70

’.
In Chapter 2 of the General Manual, for the table under the heading ‘Other regional fares’ 

substitute –
‘

EXAMPLE TRIP FULL CONCESSION TICKETS(S) ISSUED
Melbourne to Frankston $6.50 $3.70 Metcard 1+2 only
Melbourne to Rosebud $8.70 $4.80 Metcard 1+2 & Zone C 

Paper 
Melbourne to Portsea $10.00 $5.40 Metcard 1+2 & Zone 

C+D Paper 
Frankston to Mt Martha $3.00 $2.00 Metcard 2 only
Frankston to Rosebud $5.20 $3.10 Metcard 2 & Zone C 

Paper
Frankston to Portsea $6.50 $3.70 Metcard 2 & Zone C+D 

Paper
Safety Beach to Rosebud $2.20 $1.10 Zone C Paper only 
Safety Beach to Sorrento $3.50 $1.70 Zone C+D Paper only
Rosebud to Sorrento $2.20 $1.10 Zone D Paper only
Rosebud to Rye $2.20 $1.10 Zone D Paper only

’.
In Chapter 2 of the General Manual, under the heading ‘Airport services’ for the table under the 

heading ‘Skybus (Melbourne Airport – City)’ substitute –
‘

AVAILABLE FROM SINGLE RETURN
Ticket Type
Full-fare Skybus offi ce & agencies $17.00 $28.00
Child (4-14 years old) Skybus offi ce only –   $6.50
Family: (2 adults plus up 
to 4 children (4-14 years)

Skybus offi ce & agencies $38.00 $65.00

Family Flexi: (1 adult 
plus up to 4 children (4-14 
years)

Skybus offi ce & agencies/
MetShop & Online

$24.00 $40.00

Adult plus 2 hour Zone 1 
Metcard

Skybus offi ce/MetShop only $21.00 –

Adult plus Daily Zone 1 
Metcard

Skybus offi ce/MetShop only $24.00 –

’.



4 S 430 23 December 2011 Victoria Government Gazette

In Chapter 3 of the General Manual, under the heading ‘First class travel’, for the table under 
the heading ‘First class upgrades for regular travellers (Multi Cards)’ substitute –
‘

DISTANCE SINGLE TRIP MULTICARD
Less than 100 c/u $3.00 $25.00Greater than 100 c/u $6.00

’.
In Chapter 3 of the General Manual, under the heading ‘Choosing the right ticket’, in the 

second paragraph under the heading ‘Yearly’, for ‘$1859.00’ substitute – ‘$2021.50’.
In Chapter 3 of the General Manual, for the heading ‘V/Line Fare Table 2011’ and the table 

under that heading substitute –



Victoria Government Gazette   S 430 23 December 2011 5

‘V/Line Fare Table 2012
NO FIRST CLASS FARES. FIRST CLASS FARE IS NOW A TWO-TIER FLAT FEE UPGRADE ON RELEVANT ECONOMY FARE.

CHARGING UNITS 
NOT EXCEEDING SINGLE DAILY OFF-PEAK 

SINGLE
OFF-PEAK 

DAILY
OFF-PEAK 

EXTN SINGLE WEEKLY MONTHLY DATE-TO-DATE C/U

ZONE FULL CONC FULL CONC FULL CONC FULL CONC FULL CONC FULL STUDENT 
CONC FULL STUDENT 

CONC FULL STUDENT 
CONC

Weekly Unit 
Rate

B 6.50 3.70 11.90 6.30 n/a n/a 11.00 5.50 n/a n/a 55.40 27.70 189.20 94.60 n/a n/a B

10 2.20 1.10 4.40 2.20 2.20 1.10 4.40 2.20 0.00 0.00 22.00 11.00 88.00 44.00 20.30 10.10 10

20 3.50 1.70 7.00 3.50 3.50 1.70 7.00 3.50 0.00 0.00 35.00 17.50 140.00 70.00 32.20 16.10 20

30 4.00 2.00 8.00 4.00 3.70 1.80 7.40 3.60 0.30 0.20 37.00 18.50 148.00 74.00 34.00 17.00 30

40 5.20 2.60 10.40 5.20 3.90 1.90 7.80 3.80 1.30 0.70 39.00 19.50 156.00 78.00 36.00 18.00 40

50 5.90 2.90 11.80 5.80 4.10 2.00 8.20 4.00 1.80 0.90 41.00 20.50 164.00 82.00 37.80 18.90 50

60 7.40 3.70 14.80 7.40 5.20 2.60 10.40 5.20 2.20 1.10 51.00 25.50 195.80 97.90 45.10 22.50 60

70 C 9.00 4.50 18.00 9.00 6.30 3.10 12.60 6.20 2.70 1.40 59.90 29.90 215.60 107.80 49.70 24.80 70

80 D 10.30 5.10 20.60 10.20 7.20 3.60 14.40 7.20 3.10 1.50 68.50 34.20 246.60 123.30 56.30 28.10 80

90 E 11.80 5.90 23.60 11.80 8.30 4.10 16.60 8.20 3.50 1.80 72.80 36.40 262.00 131.00 58.30 29.10 90

100 F 13.50 6.70 27.00 13.40 9.50 4.70 19.00 9.40 4.00 2.00 78.00 39.00 280.90 140.40 60.30 30.10 100

110 G 14.80 7.40 29.60 14.80 10.40 5.20 20.80 10.40 4.40 2.20 86.10 43.00 310.10 155.00 62.60 31.30 110

120 H 16.70 8.30 33.40 16.60 11.70 5.80 23.40 11.60 5.00 2.50 91.60 45.80 329.70 164.80 65.40 32.70 120

130 I 18.40 9.20 36.80 18.40 12.90 6.40 25.80 12.80 5.50 2.80 99.10 49.50 356.40 178.20 66.40 33.20 130

140 J 19.90 9.90 39.80 19.80 13.90 6.90 27.80 13.80 6.00 3.00 105.80 52.90 381.40 190.70 69.80 34.90 140

150 K 21.90 10.90 43.80 21.80 15.30 7.60 30.60 15.20 6.60 3.30 111.90 55.90 402.70 201.30 71.90 35.90 150

160 L 23.60 11.80 47.20 23.60 16.50 8.20 33.00 16.40 7.10 3.60 119.50 59.70 429.50 214.70 73.50 36.70 160

170 M 25.20 12.60 50.40 25.20 17.60 8.80 35.20 17.60 7.60 3.80 125.50 62.70 452.60 226.30 75.50 37.70 170

180 N 26.50 13.20 53.00 26.40 18.60 9.30 37.20 18.60 7.90 3.90 132.60 66.30 477.60 238.80 77.90 38.90 180

190 O 28.20 14.10 56.40 28.20 19.70 9.80 39.40 19.60 8.50 4.30 140.70 70.30 506.10 253.00 78.80 39.40 190

200 P 29.80 14.90 59.60 29.80 20.90 10.40 41.80 20.80 8.90 4.50 146.80 73.40 529.30 264.60 80.00 40.00 200

220 Q 32.70 16.30 65.40 32.60 22.90 11.40 45.80 22.80 9.80 4.90 161.50 80.70 581.00 290.50 84.60 42.30 220

240 R 35.50 17.70 71.00 35.40 24.90 12.40 49.80 24.80 10.60 5.30 177.70 88.80 639.50 319.70 88.80 44.40 240

260 S 38.30 19.10 76.60 38.20 26.80 13.40 53.60 26.80 11.50 5.70 191.10 95.50 687.90 343.90 95.50 47.70 260

280 T 41.50 20.70 83.00 41.40 29.10 14.50 58.20 29.00 12.40 6.20 207.40 103.70 746.70 373.30 103.70 51.80 280

300 U 44.30 22.10 88.60 44.20 29.90 14.90 59.80 29.80 14.40 7.20 221.80 110.90 798.60 399.30 110.90 55.40 300

320 V 47.30 23.60 94.60 47.20 30.10 15.00 60.20 30.00 17.20 8.60 236.20 118.10 850.40 425.20 118.10 59.00 320

340 W 50.10 25.00 100.20 50.00 31.90 15.90 63.80 31.80 18.20 9.10 250.60 125.30 902.30 451.10 125.30 62.60 340

360 X 52.60 26.30 105.20 52.60 33.50 16.70 67.00 33.40 19.10 9.60 263.10 131.50 947.20 473.60 131.60 65.80 360

380 Y 53.60 26.80 107.20 53.60 34.10 17.00 68.20 34.00 19.50 9.80 267.90 133.90 964.50 482.20 134.00 67.00 380

400 Z 54.90 27.40 109.80 54.80 34.90 17.40 69.80 34.80 20.00 10.00 274.20 137.10 987.00 493.50 137.10 68.50 400

450 AA 56.90 28.40 113.80 56.80 36.30 18.10 72.60 36.20 20.60 10.30 284.20 142.10 1023.30 511.60 142.10 71.00 450

500 BB 59.70 29.80 119.40 59.60 38.10 19.00 76.20 38.00 21.60 10.80 298.60 149.30 1075.10 537.50 149.30 74.60 500

550 CC 62.60 31.30 125.20 62.60 39.90 19.90 79.80 39.80 22.70 11.40 312.60 156.30 1125.20 562.60 156.30 78.10 550

600 DD 65.10 32.50 130.20 65.00 41.40 20.70 82.80 41.40 23.70 11.80 325.50 162.70 1171.90 585.90 162.80 81.40 600

650 EE 66.80 33.40 133.60 66.80 42.50 21.20 85.00 42.40 24.30 12.20 334.20 167.10 1203.00 601.50 167.10 83.50 650

700 FF 72.10 36.00 144.20 72.00 46.00 23.00 92.00 46.00 26.10 13.00 360.60 180.30 1298.10 649.00 180.30 90.10 700

750 GG 76.10 38.00 152.20 76.00 48.50 24.20 97.00 48.40 27.60 13.80 380.70 190.30 1370.70 685.30 190.40 95.20 750

800 HH 79.00 39.50 158.00 79.00 50.30 25.10 100.60 50.20 28.70 14.40 394.70 197.30 1420.80 710.40 197.30 98.60 800

800+ II 79.00 39.50 158.00 79.00 50.30 25.10 100.60 50.20 28.70 14.40 394.70 197.30 1420.80 710.40 197.30 98.60 800+

’.



6 S 430 23 December 2011 Victoria Government Gazette

In Chapter 4 of the General Manual, for the heading ‘Victorian Student Passes’ substitute 
‘Regional Transit Student Passes’.

In Chapter 4 of the General Manual, for the table under the heading ‘Regional Transit Student 
Passes’ substitute –
‘

HALF- 
YEARLY

YEARLY TRAVEL 
ENTITLEMENTS

AVAILABLE 
FROM

Southwest Transit 
Student Pass

$125.90 $236.40 Unlimited travel in the 
Southwest Transit System

Warrnambool Bus 
Lines

Colac Transit 
Student Pass

$177.90 $355.80 Unlimited travel in the 
Colac Transit System

Colac Transit

Portland Transit 
Student Pass

$177.90 $355.80 Unlimited travel in the 
Portland Transit System

Portland Bus Lines

’.
In Chapter 5 of the General Manual, for the table under the heading ‘Regional City & Town 

Service Fares – Category A’ substitute –
‘

FARE 
ONE 

ZONE

FARES
TWO 

ZONES

LOCATION

Full Fare 2 hour $2.20 $3.50 Bacchus Marsh
Bairnsdale
Benalla
Cobram
Colac
Drouin
Echuca/Moama
Hamilton
Horsham
Kilmore
Korumburra
Lakes Entrance
Mildura
Portland
Rochester
Sale
Shepparton/Mooroopna
Swan Hill
Wangaratta
Warrnambool
Wonthaggi

Concession 2 hour $1.10 $1.70

Full fare Daily $3.70 $7.00

Concession Daily $1.80 $3.50

Full fare Weekly $18.40 $34.80

Concession Weekly $9.20 $17.40

Full fare Monthly $80.00 $138.60

Concession Monthly $40.00 $69.30

’.
In Chapter 5 of the General Manual, for the table under the heading ‘Regional City & Town 

Service Fares – Category B’ substitute –
‘

FARE
ONE ZONE

LOCATION

Full fare 2 hour $1.60 Ararat
Beaufort
Stawell

Concession 2 hour $1.00
Student Weekly $5.80

 ’. 



Victoria Government Gazette   S 430 23 December 2011 7

In Chapter 8 of the General Manual, in the second paragraph under the heading ‘Cloakrooms’, 
for ‘$2.60’ substitute ‘$3.00’.

In Chapter 8 of the General Manual, in the fifth paragraph under the heading ‘Cloakrooms’ for 
‘They must pay any outstanding charges along with a $1.20 search fee.’ substitute ‘They must pay 
any outstanding charges.’.



8 S 430 23 December 2011 Victoria Government Gazette

  How To Order

  Mail Order Victoria Government Gazette
  Level 5, 460 Bourke Street

  Melbourne 3000
  PO Box 1957 Melbourne 3001
   DX 106 Melbourne
 Telephone (03) 8523 4601

 Fax (03) 9600 0478

 email  gazette@bluestargroup.com.au

 Retail & Victoria Government Gazette
 Mail Sales Level 5, 460 Bourke Street

  Melbourne 3000
  PO Box 1957 Melbourne 3001
 Telephone (03) 8523 4601

 Fax (03) 9600 0478

 Retail  Victorian Government Bookshop
 Sales Level 20, 80 Collins Street

  Melbourne 3000
 Telephone 1300 366 356

 Fax (03) 9603 9920

Price Code A

✆

✆

✆

FAX

FAX

FAX

The Victoria Government Gazette is published 
by Blue Star Print with the authority of the 
Government Printer for the State of Victoria
© State of Victoria 2011
This publication is copyright. No part may be 
reproduced by any process except in accordance 
with the provisions of the Copyright Act.
Address all enquiries to the Government Printer 
for the State of Victoria 
Level 2, 1 Macarthur Street
Melbourne 3002 
Victoria Australia



<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (Generic CMYK Profile)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /OK
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.1000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /sRGB
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 1
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness false
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments false
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts true
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue false
  /ColorSettingsFile (None)
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages false
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages true
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 150
  /ColorImageDepth -1
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.16667
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages true
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 1.30
    /HSamples [2 1 1 2] /VSamples [2 1 1 2]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages false
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages true
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 150
  /GrayImageDepth -1
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.16667
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages true
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 1.30
    /HSamples [2 1 1 2] /VSamples [2 1 1 2]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages false
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages true
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Average
  /MonoImageResolution 150
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck false
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly false
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError true
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (None)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<
    /CHS <FEFF4f7f75288fd94e9b8bbe5b9a521b5efa7684002000500044004600206587686353ef901a8fc7684c976262535370673a548c002000700072006f006f00660065007200208fdb884c9ad88d2891cf62535370300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c676562535f00521b5efa768400200050004400460020658768633002>
    /CHT <FEFF4f7f752890194e9b8a2d7f6e5efa7acb7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065874ef653ef5728684c9762537088686a5f548c002000700072006f006f00660065007200204e0a73725f979ad854c18cea7684521753706548679c300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c4f86958b555f5df25efa7acb76840020005000440046002065874ef63002>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /FRA <>
    /ITA <>
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <FEFFc7740020c124c815c7440020c0acc6a9d558c5ec0020b370c2a4d06cd0d10020d504b9b0d1300020bc0f0020ad50c815ae30c5d0c11c0020ace0d488c9c8b85c0020c778c1c4d560002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020bb38c11cb97c0020c791c131d569b2c8b2e4002e0020c774b807ac8c0020c791c131b41c00200050004400460020bb38c11cb2940020004100630072006f0062006100740020bc0f002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e00300020c774c0c1c5d0c11c0020c5f40020c2180020c788c2b5b2c8b2e4002e>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken voor kwaliteitsafdrukken op desktopprinters en proofers. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 5.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /PTB <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /ENU (Acrobat 8 Distiller settings for the Blue Star Print Group. Use these settings to create PDF documents required for the Gazette Website.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks true
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /BleedOffset [
        22.677170
        22.677170
        22.677170
        22.677170
      ]
      /ConvertColors /NoConversion
      /DestinationProfileName (U.S. Web Coated \(SWOP\) v2)
      /DestinationProfileSelector /UseName
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /MediumResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure true
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MarksOffset 22.677170
      /MarksWeight 0.250000
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /UseName
      /PageMarksFile /RomanDefault
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
    <<
      /AllowImageBreaks true
      /AllowTableBreaks true
      /ExpandPage false
      /HonorBaseURL true
      /HonorRolloverEffect false
      /IgnoreHTMLPageBreaks false
      /IncludeHeaderFooter false
      /MarginOffset [
        0
        0
        0
        0
      ]
      /MetadataAuthor ()
      /MetadataKeywords ()
      /MetadataSubject ()
      /MetadataTitle ()
      /MetricPageSize [
        0
        0
      ]
      /MetricUnit /inch
      /MobileCompatible 0
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (GoLive)
        (8.0)
      ]
      /OpenZoomToHTMLFontSize false
      /PageOrientation /Portrait
      /RemoveBackground false
      /ShrinkContent true
      /TreatColorsAs /MainMonitorColors
      /UseEmbeddedProfiles false
      /UseHTMLTitleAsMetadata true
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [72 72]
  /PageSize [595.276 841.890]
>> setpagedevice


